
   

Item 
Estimated 

Annual Usage
Unit Warehouse Part 

Number
Item Description Vendor Part 

Number
Unit Price Ext. Price Notes

Vendor Part 

Number
Unit Price Ext. Price Notes

WAREHOUSE PARTS LIST

1 12 EA 34001 ELZS8WSSP Wtr Fill Station 99772084 $1,829.92 $21,959.04 ELZS8WSSP $1,940.38 $23,284.56

2 5 EA 34005 CLOSET BOWL - WALL MOUNT, 4 HOLE K4325-0  #ZURZ5615BWL $115.00 $575.00  NO BID Z5615BWL $115.00 $575.00

3 10 EA 34010
TOILET BOWL- 1.1/1.6 GAL/FLUSH- ELONGATED BOWL-WHITE- 

#AMS2234001020
$96.93 $969.30  NO BID 2234001020 $96.93 $969.30

4 8 EA 34015 LAVATORY - WALL HUNG 20" X 18" 3H ADA WM 4 CC- #PF5514WH $68.18 $545.44  NO BID 035501202U $68.18 $545.44

5 4 EA 34023 KOHLER- 1/8-1.0 gallons Urinal- K4991-ET-0 (WHITE)-#ZURZ5755 $236.40 $945.60  NO BID Z5755 $236.40 $945.60

6 4 EA 34023 KOHLER- 1/8-1.0 gallons Urinal- K4991-ET-0 (WHITE)-#ZURZ5755 $236.40 $945.60  NO BID Z5755 $236.40 $945.60

7 5 EA 34025 WATER COOLER - ELKAY-  EZS8L  - #EE258L 99014832 $806.48 $4,032.40 E258L $938.91 $4,694.55

8 50 EA 42010 COMPRESSION COUPLING - 3/8" BRASS- #440407-131280 71761 $1.67 $83.50 626C $1.66 $83.00

9 40 EA 42080 LOSET SUPPLY - 3/8" X 3/8" 30" STAINLESS FLEX- LSFC530PP $7.00 $280.00  NO BID SFC530PP $7.00 $280.00

10 10 EA 42085 LF LAV SUPPLY - 1/2" X 3/8" X 20"  FLEX BRAIDED SS- #146474 70155 $4.96 $49.60 SFC120PP $3.01 $30.10

11 250 EA 42093 TOILET REPAIR KIT 3.5 GPF-    #P6000-ECR-WS-RK 99316245 $14.89 $3,722.50
PG000ECRW

S
$24.20 $6,050.00
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