




28260 A/C FILTER - 24 3/4 x 8 3/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 300  $                          6.30 1,890.00$                   $                          2.00 600.00$                       $                          2.79 837.00$                      

28270 A/C FILTER - 25 x 8 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 14  $                          6.18 86.52$                         $                          2.00 28.00$                         $                          2.79 39.06$                        

28280 A/C FILTER - 25 x 16 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 118  $                          2.52 297.36$                       $                          2.47 291.46$                       $                          2.94 346.92$                      

28281 A/C FILTER - 25 3/4 x 9 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 92  $                          6.55 602.60$                       $                          2.00 184.00$                       $                          2.79 256.68$                      

28282 A/C FILTER - 25 3/4 x 9 1/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                          6.96 13.92$                         $                          2.00 4.00$                            $                          2.79 5.58$                           

28290 A/C FILTER - 25 x 20 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 24  $                          2.74 65.76$                         $                          2.71 65.04$                         $                          2.94 70.56$                        

28300 A/C FILTER - 25 x 25 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                          3.27 6.54$                           $                          2.87 5.74$                            $                          3.08 6.16$                           

28305 A/C FILTER - 25 1/2 x 18 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                          8.60 17.20$                         $                          2.48 4.96$                            $                          2.95 5.90$                           

28310 A/C FILTER - 25 3/4 x 7 1/2 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                          6.20 12.40$                         $                          1.85 3.70$                            $                          2.79 5.58$                           

28320 A/C FILTER - 26 x 8 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 90  $                          6.15 553.50$                       $                          2.00 180.00$                       $                          2.79 251.10$                      

28325 A/C FILTER - 26 x 12 3/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                          7.38 14.76$                         $                          2.29 4.58$                            $                          2.95 5.90$                           

28335 A/C FILTER - 27 x 8 3/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                          6.96 13.92$                         $                          2.00 4.00$                            $                          2.79 5.58$                           

28340 A/C FILTER - 27 x 10 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 7  $                          6.96 48.72$                         $                          2.10 14.70$                         $                          2.79 19.53$                        

28350 A/C FILTER - 27 1/8 x 23 1/4 x 1





28580 A/C FILTER - 38 3/4 x 13 1/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 36  $                          9.60 345.60$                       $                          3.74 



28842 A/C FILTER - 61 x 9 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 120  $                        14.10 1,692.00$                   $                          3.73 447.60$                       $                        11.89 1,426.80$                   

28845 A/C FILTER - 62 x 10 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 6  $                        16.86 101.16$                       $                          4.02 24.12$                         $                        11.89 71.34$                        

28850 A/C FILTER - 65 1/2 x 9 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 68  $                        14.40 979.20$                       $                          7.38 501.84$                       $                        11.89 808.52$                      

28860 A/C FILTER - 70 x 11 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 68  $                        18.50 1,258.00$                   $                          8.05 547.40$                       $                        12.54 852.72$                      

28870 A/C FILTER - 77 1/2 x 9 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 16  $                        16.86 269.76$                       $                          8.05 128.80$                       $                        12.54 200.64$                      

28880 A/C FILTER - 77 1/2 x 13 1/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2  $                        26.46 52.92$                         $                          9.76 19.52$                         $                        12.55 25.10$                        

29005 PLEATED FILTER - 20 x 8 1/2 x 1 Pleated 12  $                          6.20 74.40$                         $                          5.29 63.48$                         $                          4.38 52.56$                        

29007 PLEATED FILTER - 22 x 20 x 1 Pleated 2  $                          8.10 16.20$                         $                          3.75 7.50$                            $                          3.88 7.76$                           

29010 PLEATED FILTER - 16 x 15 x 2 Pleated 12  $                          9.27 111.24$                       $                          5.82 69.84$                         $                          6.30 75.60$                        

29020 PLEATED FILTER - 16 x 16 x 2 Pleated 8  $                          2.91 23.28$                         $                          3.32 26.56$                         $                          2.79 22.32$                        

29025 PLEATED FILTER - 17 3/4 x 17 3/4 x 2 Pleated 6  $                          3.27 19.62$                         $                          6.78 40.68$                         $                          6.57 39.42$                        

29030 PLEATED FILTER - 19 1/2 x 16 1/2 x 2 Pleated 16  $                        16.62 265.92$                       $                          6.78 108.48$                       $                          6.57 105.12$                      





29580



29657 POLY FILTER-  66 X 24 Poly 8  NO BID -$                             $                        16.93 135.44$                       $                        14.52 116.16$                      

29660 POLY FILTER - 68 x 20 Poly 2  NO BID -$                             $                        12.46 24.92$                         $                        13.37 26.74$                        

29670 POLY FILTER - 68 x 25 Poly 2  NO BID -$                             $                        13.99 27.98$                         $                        15.05 30.10$                        

29690 POLY FILTER - 80 x 20 Poly 2  $                        19.14 38.28$                         $                        16.13 32.26$                         $                        15.05 30.10$                        

29700 POLY FILTER - 80 x 25 Poly 2  $                        23.54 47.08$                         $                        17.68 35.36$                         $                        16.85 33.70$                        

29705 POLY FILTER-  88 X 25 Poly 8  $                        27.00 216.00$                       $                        18.65 149.20$                       $                        18.79 150.32$                      

29720 POLY FILTER - 108 x 25 Poly 6  $                        35.18 211.08$                       $                        37.99 227.94$                       $                        21.06 126.36$                      

29730 POLY FILTER - 110 x 16 Poly 24  $                        26.06 625.44$                       $                        35.06 841.44$                       $                        20.52 492.48$                      

29732 POLY FILTER-  112 X 25 Poly 8  $                        33.56 268.48$                       $                        37.99 303.92$                       $                        26.32 210.56$                      

29733 POLY FILTER-  36 X 24 Poly 2  $                        11.12 22.24$                         $                          8.31 16.62$                         $                          7.76 15.52$                        

30010 ROLL FILTER - 22 1/4 x 1 (POLY) Roll 1  NO BID -$                             $                      153.12 153.12$                       $                      114.05 114.05$                      

30020 ROLL FILTER - 21 7/8 x 3 (POLY) Roll 1  NO BID -$                             $                      134.98 134.98$                       $                        93.75 93.75$                        

30030 ROLL FILTER - 24 7/8 x 1 (POLY) Roll 2  NO BID -$                             $                      139.98 279.96$                       $                      118.89 237.78$                      

30040 ROLL FILTER - 31 7/8 x 1 (POLY) Roll 1  NO BID -$                             $                      151.62 151.62$                       $                      126.19 126.19$                      



30530
CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 20 x 12- Single Header, 

Side Access Gasket, 65% Eff
Cartridge 22  $                        85.49 1,880.78$                   $                        67.66 1,488.52$                    $                        59.06 1,299.32$                   

30540
CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 24 x 12- Single Header, 

Side Access Gasket, 65% Eff
Cartridge 11  $                        69.06 759.66$                       $                        74.78 822.58$                       $                        61.33 674.63$                      

30550

CARTRIDGE FILTER 20 X 20 X 4 - Legacy- 

Header/Lip Required Ultra 4, Merv 11 (60-65%), 

Plastic Single HDR Frame

Cartridge 14  $                        61.56 861.84$                       $                        522 697.9267.E29 $                       $                        522 697.9267.E( )6( )6(4%)8())10T
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30560

CARTRIDGE FILTER 24 X 20 X 4 - Legacy- 

Header/Lip Required, Ultra 4, Merv 11 (60-65%), 

Plastic Single HDR Frame

Cartridge 18  $                        62.45 1,124.10$                   $                        55.99 1,007.82$                    $                        59.22 1,065.96$                   

30570

CARTRIDGE FILTER 24 X 24 X 4 - Legacy- 

Header/Lip Required, Ultra 4, MERV 11 (60-

65%), Plastic Single HDR Frame

Cartridge 1  $                        64.97 64.97$                         $                        62.74 62.74$                         $                        65.19 65.19$                        

30575

CARTRIDGE FILTER 12 X 24 X 12- Galv. Frame, 

No Header, Foam Gasket Downstream (Air Exit 

Side) ** Must have 2 Spring Clips Holes on Both 

Cartridge 3  $                        53.16 159.48$                       $                        44.79 134.37$                       $                        43.71 131.13$                      

30580

CARTRIDGE FILTER 24 X 20 X 12- Galv. Frame, 

No Header, Foam Gasket Downstream Side (Air 

Exit Side) **Must have 2 Spring Clips Holes on 

Cartridge 12  $                        73.77 885.24$                       $                        64.15 769.80$                       $                        59.49 713.88$                      

30700 REGULAR FILTER- 19 3/4 X 21 1/2 X 1 Regular Fiberglass 24  $                          8.60 206.40$                       $                          2.59 62.16$                         $                          7.41 177.84$                     


