

iCube / 136174700
 Out-of-Home Advertising
 10/16/2020
 Donna Wallis

Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.

Email Address: dwallis@tntech.edu

Qty	Unit	Item Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
1	ea	pump topper	\$ 379.00	\$ 379.00	no bid	\$ -	\$ 390.00	\$ 390.00
1	ea	gas nozzles	\$ 364.00	\$ 364.00	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -
1	ea	ice box wraps	\$ 860.00	\$ 860.00	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -
1	ea	window clings	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	no bid	\$ -	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00
1	ea	outdoor posters	\$ 220.00	\$ 220.00	no bid	\$ -	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00
1	ea	floor graphics	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	no bid	\$ -	\$ 310.00	\$ 310.00
1	ea	cooler handles	\$ 503.00	\$ 503.00	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -
1	ea	squawker	\$ 189.00	\$ 189.00	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -
1	ea	standee (gas stations)	\$ 365.00	\$ 365.00	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -
100,000	ea	coasters	\$ 879.00	\$ 879.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00
100,000	ea	napkins	\$ 783.00	\$ 783.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 640.00
1	ea	posters	\$ 325.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 880.00	\$ 880.00
1	ea	mirror cling	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	free of chg	\$ -	no bid	\$ -
1	ea	table tent	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	free of chg	\$ -	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00
1	ea	floor graphics	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	no bid	\$ -	\$ 930.00	\$ 930.00

1 ea	standee (bars)	\$ 365.00	\$ 365.00	no bid	\$ -	\$ 920.00	\$ 920.00
1 ea	standee (doctor's offices)	\$ 325.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	no bid	\$ -
1 ea	brochure	no bid	\$ -	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 175.00
TOTAL:			\$1,653.00		\$ -		\$ 540.00

10/21/2020

Note to Bidders: If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date. After that time, additional information about a public records request may be found at [http://1 \(dder\)-6.4 -1.1 \(pTj 0 63u1 \(he l\)-1.1 \(nt\)-1.1 \(ennD\)-2.9 \(at\)-1.1 \(e.\)-1.1 MC 2.9ues\)2d68-1.1 MC 2.9uesenT EMC e.eV- .01 \(pTj](http://1 (dder)-6.4 -1.1 (pTj 0 63u1 (he l)-1.1 (nt)-1.1 (ennD)-2.9 (at)-1.1 (e.)-1.1 MC 2.9ues)2d68-1.1 MC 2.9uesenT EMC e.eV- .01 (pTj)