Department / Requisition: (various)

Description of Bid: Lab Sciences Building Ancillary Equipment
Opening Date: 8/25/2020
Prepared by: Donna Wallis
Quantity Item Description Equivalent To: Part / Mfg. Number
Digital Pocket Scale, Black, 650 American Weigh Scale Ac- 650 Digital Pocke
32 X01G Scale, Black, 650 G X 0.1 G no bid
Kitchen Scale (5.000 kg with 2L Etekcity 11lb 5kg Digital Multifunction Food
15 stainless bowl) Kitchen Scale no bid
Top loading balance - 0.01g
readability, 300-500g capacity,
draft shield minimum
48 requirements Fisher 14-557-432 no bid
20 Analytical balance Mettler XSR204 no bid
Solution Calorimeter, ISO
9001:2008, ethernet or USB
1 connector Parr 6755 Solution Calorimeter no bid

Unit Price

n/a

n/a

n/a

n/a

n/a

Part / Mfg. Number

702357

no bid

702017
702553

no bid

Unit Price

$12.43

n/a

$340.00

n/a

n/a

Part / Mfg. Number

no bid

10123-890

76412-354
76292-098

89029-776

Unit Price

n/a

$340.66

$560.47
$5,631.33

$7,783.04

Part / Mfg. Number

no bid

no bid

14-557-432 | PRACTUM412-1S
01-919-151/XSR204

04-731-192/ 6755EA

Unit Price

n/a

n/a

$540.95
$5,404.31

$8,547.27

Award To:

CAROLINA

NO AWARD

NO AWARD
FISHER

VWR









PR RPPPRPRPRPPRPPRERPRRPRP

12
50
100
10

72
150
78

142
182

PR R PR

Cork stopper, 0, pk/100
Cork stopper, 1, pk/100
Cork stopper, 2, pk/100
Cork stopper, 3, pk/100
Cork stopper, 4, pk/100

Cork stopper, 5, pk/100
Cork stopper, 6, pk/100
Cork stopper, 7, pk/100
Cork stopper, 8, pk/100
Cork stopper, 9, pk/100
Cork stopper, 10, pk/100
Cork stopper, 11, pk/100
Cork stopper, 13, pk/100
Cork stopper, 14, pk/100
Walter crucible holder
Dessicator, glass, 200 mm
diameter

Clear 12-well plate with lid
Clear 6-well plate with lid
Hanging Clips

Liquid Nitrogen Dewar Flask,
Nalgene, All-Plastic HDPE, 4L
Funnels, Pyrex Fluted Bowl
150mm Stem

Funnel, Buchner, PP, 55 mm
Funnel, Buchner, PP, 70 mm

Liquid Nitrogen Transfer Vessel,

5L
Ring Clamp
Ring stand

Silicone Bulb-Type Safety Pipet

Filler

Rubber stopper, 00, pk/105
Rubber stopper, 0, pk/77
Rubber stopper, 1, pk/57
Rubber stopper, 2, pk/52
Rubber stopper, 3, pk/39

Fisher 07-781C
Fisher 07-781D
Fisher 07-781E
Fisher 07-781F
Fisher 07-781G
Fisher 07-781H
Fisher 07-781J
Fisher 07-781K
Fisher 07-781L
Fisher 07-781M
Fisher 07-781N
Fisher 07-781P
Fisher 07-781Q
Fisher 07-781R
Fisher 08-285

Fisher 08-615A
Fisher 08-772-29
Fisher 08-772-33
Fisher 09-682-726

Fisher 10-194-100B

Fisher 10-326-2C
Fisher 10-362B
Fisher 10-362C

Fisher 11-670-5A
Fisher 12-000-109
Fisher 12-947-976

Fisher 13-681-102A
Fisher 14-130A
Fisher 14-130B
Fisher 14-130C
Fisher 14-130D
Fisher 14-130E

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a
n/a

712161
712163
712165
712167
712169
712171
712173
712175
712177
712179
712181
712183
no bid

712187
no bid

no bid
703467
703468
no bid

no bid

no bid
734624
734626

no bid
707244
707163

736869
712400
712401
712402
712403

$5.43
$5.59
$6.31
$6.50
$6.99
$7.98
$7.71
$9.20
$12.39
$16.87
$14.29
$18.01
n/a
$33.48
n/a

n/a
$5.40
$5.40
n/a

n/a

n/a
$9.69
$11.67

n/a
$7.22
$13.19

$14.59
$11.21
$11.21
$11.21
$11.21

23420-071
23420-082
23420-107
23420-129
23420-140
23420-162
23420-184
23420-209
23420-220
23420-242
23420-264
23420-286
23420-322
76293-850
470151-210

25020-020
62406-165
21100-002
97054-324

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
470157-270
89233-992

53497-053
59580-069
59580-080
59580-105
59580-127

$24.65
$7.62
$9.69
$7.72
$8.70
$9.15
$14.84
$8.61
$11.96
$16.49
$21.93
$28.47
$32.38
$59.35
$36.15

$82.81
$119.70
$133.12
$56.59

n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

n/a
$5.68
$49.29

$21.26

$111.29
$100.85
$106.63
$108.40

07-781C/ F-07781C-0XXX
07-781D/ F-07781D-1XXX
07-781E / F-07781E-2XXX
07-781F / F-07781F-3XXX
07-781G / F-07781G-4XXX
07-781H / F-07781H-5XXX
07-781J / F-07781J-6XXX
07-781K /F-07781K-7XXX
07-781L /F-07781L-8XXX
07-781M / F-07781M-9XXX
07-781N /F-07781N-10XXX
07-781P / F-07781P-11XXX
07-781Q / F-07781Q-12XXX
07-781R / F-07781R-13XXX
08-285 / VCHWGS

08-615A / 683-1/P
08-772-29/ 353043
08-772-33 / 353934
09-682-726 / 3869500

10-194-100B / 4150-2000

10-326-2C / 6160-75
10-362B / 4280-0550
10-362C / 4280-0700

11-670-5A/ TY509X1
12-000-109 / CHO674C
12-947-976 / H18303-0005

13-681-102A/ 13 681 102A
14-130A/ 00M290
14-130B / 0M290
14-130C / 1M290
14-130D / 2M290

$3.00
$3.00
$3.00
$3.00
$3.00
$3.00
$3.00
$4.00
$5.00
$6.00
$10.00
$13.00
$17.00
$15.00
$8.95

$189.20
$1.84
$2.08
$4.88

$193.17

$11.98
$7.87
$10.03

$973.26
$6.76
$58.20

$26.28
$16.80
$17.71
$17.10
$19.76

FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER

VWR
FISHER
FISHER
FISHER

FISHER

FISHER
FISHER
FISHER

FISHER
VWR
CAROLINA

CAROLINA
CAROLINA
CAROLINA
CAROLINA
CAROLINA






46 Rubber Policeman Fisher S66002 no bid n/a 711312 $5.62 53800-005 $23.12 S66002 / GRPL08 $0.20 FISHER
2 Fuming Hotplate Fisher S69026A no bid n/a 211980 $23.13 470020-328 $18.49 S69026A / FHP100 $18.27 FISHER
2 Portable Fuming Chamber Fisher S69028A no bid n/a no bid n/a
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32

Explosion-proof
refrigerator/freezer, 10.1 cu. Ft.,
115V 60 Hz, deg. C. to 12 deg.
C. (refrigerator), -12 deg. C to -2
deg.C. (freezer)
Explosion-proof
refrigerator/freezer, 10.1 cu. Ft.,
115V 60 Hz, 1 deg. C. to 12 de!
C. (refrigerator), -12 deg. C to -2
deg.C. (freezer)

Heated Ultrasonic Cleaning Bat!
9.5L, 120V, 40Hz

Fisher FBHO7CESA

Fisher TSHO7CESA
Fisher 15-337-426
Automated solid-phase extractiofiPromoChrom SPE-03

Spectrophotometer - double
beam, xenon flash lamp, 190-
1100 nm minimum requirements Fisher 14-385-354

American Weigh Scales

Calibration weight for digital sca

Carbon steel, Chrome finish, 50 Amazon BO02SVQHFQ
Equal Mass Kit Classroom Set Flinn AP6147

Specific Gravity Specimens, set Flinn AP9235

UV Linearity Reference Set Starna RM-040812162024
Didymium Glass Wavelength

Reference Standard

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

n/a

n/a

n/a

n/a

n/a

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a

n/a

n/a

no bid

no bid

653323

702465
no bid

752490
no bid

$4,400.00

$4,400.00
n/a

n/a

$2,721.75

$13.30
n/a

$12.88
n/a

no bid

no bid

89375-496

no bid

no bid

76404-666
470230-042

470005-426
76016-848

n/a

n/a

$1,176.61

n/a

n/a

$63.65
$12.57

$11.59
$1,790.12

FBHO7CESA/

Fisher TSHO7CESA

15-336-123 / CPX-952-518R

no bid

14-385-354 / 840-309000

no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

$2,544.86

$2,544.86
$1,017.56

n/a

$5,919.36

n/a
n/a

n/a
n/a

NO AWARD

NO AWARD

FISHER

NO AWARD

FISHER

CAROLINA
NO AWARD

NO AWARD
NO AWARD
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Voltage probe Vernier VP-BTA
Emission spectrometer Vernier VSP-EM

Fiber, Accessory for Vernier

Spectrometer Vernier VSP-EM-FIBER
Digital Thermometer with

Stainless-Steel Stem and .025 ii

LCD screen Fisher 06-664-35
Waterproof Food Thermometer

with Holders Fisher 14-649-101

6-in C-Clamp Lowes (IRWIN) 1901235
8-in C-Clamp Lowes (IRWIN) 1901236

20-Piece Plastic Handle

VP-BTA
VSP-EM

VSP-EM-FIBER

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

$11.64
$799.00

$88.00

n/a

n/a
n/a
n/a

no bid
no bid

no bid

745360

no bid
no bid
no bid

n/a
n/a

n/a

$15.81

n/a
n/a
n/a

470017-076
470016-640

470116-642

37000-414

36934-168
76293-518
no bid

$11.61
$776.59

$86.12

$45.56

$26.12
$5.54
n/a

S16072ND /VP-BTA
S16283ND / VSP-EM

S16284ND / VSP-EM-FIBER

06-664-35 / 4369

14-649-101 / 4421
no bid
no bid

$11.46
$763.37

$83.11

$40.29

$23.43
n/a
n/a

NO AWARD
FISHER

FISHER

FISHER

FISHER
NO AWARD
NO AWARD



1 Vaccum oven (1.7 cu. Ft.) Chemglass CLS-3450-217 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76414-868 50-143-536/ CLS-3450-217 $7,140.00




	Totals

